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Hope wisdom guides you. 



August 22, 2025 

It’s intelligence to recognize a fool, wisdom not to be one. 

August 15, 2025 

Everybody talks about the long-term, yet few survive it. 

August 9, 2025 

It’s ruinous reputation that unites economists. 

August 3, 2025 

Hipsters perform worse than random. 

July 21, 2025 

People hate politicians’ lies, but truth-telling politicians 
suffer defeats in elections. 



July 19, 2025 

Catching black swans is a true test for AI. 

July 17, 2025 

Democracy of fools constantly elects bullshitters into 
power. 

July 15, 2025 

There are countless stories of naive good guys destroyed by 
cynical bad guys. 

July 10, 2025 

The success of current AI reflects how little we know. 
What’s in my pocket? 



July 9, 2025 

Too much literature on tracking friends through maps, too 
little on making friends. 

July 7, 2025 

Those with a bigger mouth are not necessarily more 
truthful. 

July 5, 2025 

Palestine got destroyed while Black Swan made best selling 
list again. Taleb is indeed antifragile. 

July 3, 2025 

It’s hard to admit, but Chomsky is a hipster. 



June 23, 2025 

Those who assert democracy also run intelligence agencies. 

June 22, 2025 

Most women care about wealth, not truth. 

June 20, 2025 

The wise can profit because masses are shallow. 

June 12, 2025 

Politician is the class that can commit crimes without 
consequences. 

June 11, 2025 

History is not non-fiction, some of which is useful. 



May 25, 2025 

Most cultural institutions are about power, not culture. 

May 21, 2025 

Humans have comfort zones, which gives AI some 
advantage. 

May 17, 2025 

There is a difference between being original and being 
right. 

May 15, 2025 

Maps can make you more friends than Facebook. 

May 14, 2025 

Prudence doesn’t necessarily mean conservative. 



May 6, 2025 

There are much more people willing to betray Christ than 
defend him. 

May 4, 2025 

Much of the education system is to hide the undesirable 
truths from students. 

May 3, 2025 

Do not presume the liquid is water. 

April 30, 2025 

You know how bad the world is when all you can get is the 
lesser of two evils. 



April 29, 2025 

Principle of Computational Equivalence is modern 
superstition. 

April 27, 2025 

Many relations in life aren’t transitive. 

April 24, 2025 

The left who can not survive in the market called it a failure 
of capitalism. 

April 15, 2025 

Conservatives believe the oppressor is right. Liberals 
believe the oppressed is right. Political bias is powerful. 



April 12, 2025 

Do not mistake the prophet for the culprit. 

April 11, 2025 

Efficiency is no remedy for extreme stupidity. 

April 9, 2025 

So many people want to save America for themselves. So 
few people want to save America. 

April 6, 2025 

From antitrust to tariffs, USA politicians sought every way 
to destroy the iPhone, which says something. 



March 28, 2025 

Mistaking a Jedi for a Sith can be as damaging as mistaking 
a Sith for a Jedi. 

March 27, 2025 

Why were so many great men assassinated? 

March 25, 2025 

Economists aren’t the brightest people. 

March 24, 2025 

Newspapers say they are objective and impartial, because 
they are subjective and partial. 

March 23, 2025 

Don’t mess with fools. They can hurt you. 



March 16, 2025 

There is good reason why it’s computational complexity 
theory, not computational simplicity theory. 

March 8, 2025 

Garbage in, garbage out. AI is no different. 

March 7, 2025 

Friendship can teach you what can’t be learned in school. 

March 3, 2025 

Cherish freedom. 



March 2, 2025 

Politicians interpret electoral triumph as support, rather 
than comparative palatability, which is a form of 
confirmation bias. 

February 26, 2025 

Democrats tried to beat Darth Sidious with Jar Jar Binks. 

February 25, 2025 

It helps to explain why smart people are ruled by stupid 
people. 

February 24, 2025 

Some people define complexity theory as the study of 
computation. Thus, it’s tautological that complexity is 
computation. But, there is a broader view. You may find it 
on Glacier Studio Blog. 



February 23, 2025 

There are illiberal democracies. 

February 22, 2025 

Freedom allows truth to survive. A land of truth is too 
much to hope for. 

February 21, 2025 

Many people want to be rich. Few people want to know 
how to be rich. 

February 20, 2025 

We understand clock ticks. We don’t understand time. 
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